
Kenmore-Town of Tonawanda Union Free School District

Middle School Summer Skill
Building Program

Summer 2022

JULY 6 – AUGUST 11

Monday-Thursday
(Friday, July 8th will be a student attendance day)

8:15 am - 12:16 pm

Location

FRANKLIN MIDDLE SCHOOL

540 Parkhurst Blvd.

Tonawanda, N.Y. 14223

716.871.2080



Summer School Principal

Michael B. Haggerty

Instructional Schedule:

--First Day of Classes:  Wednesday, July 6

--Last Day of Classes: Thursday, August 11

WHO MAY ATTEND SUMMER SCHOOL?

Any invited Ken-Ton student in grades 5, 6 or 7 who are
performing significantly below grade levels in ELA/Math, and
would benefit from the summer Academic Support in the Core
Subject areas.

TRANSPORTATION

Any student who lives more than 0.75 miles from Franklin
Middle School (540 Parkhurst Blvd., NY 14223) is eligible for
transportation. Parents may choose to opt-out of Transportation if
they prefer.

COMPUTER DEVICES:

Students will bring their issued Chromebooks to the Summer
Skill Building Program.

BREAKFAST & LUNCH

Breakfast is offered to all students free of charge.

SUMMER SCHOOL CONDUCT

Expectations for behavior during summer school are the same as
those during the regular school year.  Students attending Ken-Ton



Summer School are expected to follow the District Code of
Conduct which will be implemented throughout the summer
school program.

DRESS CODE

Dress code should be in compliance with our Student Appearance
Code located in our Code of Conduct. Shorts should be of
acceptable length. Bare midriffs and spaghetti straps are not
permitted.

ACADEMIC SUCCESS

A successful learner participates in classroom activities daily.
This program has limited spaces available; if a student is not able
to attend the full program, please do not take a space from another
child.

GOALS

The specific goals of this program are to increase student
performance in all core subject areas through appropriate
hands-on applications and/or programs that will integrate all
disciplines in alignment to Common Core Learning Standards.
Students will focus, specifically, on building literacy and
numeracy skills. Students will also engage in collaborative team
building activities, with a focus on social-emotional well being.

https://www.ktufsd.org/Page/56
https://www.ktufsd.org/Page/56

